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MESSAGE FROM THE PRESIDENT AND EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR 

 
Dear Board of Directors, Members and Supporters: 
 
As President and Executive Director of The Ivy Community Charities of Prince 
George’s County, Inc. (Charities), we are proud to present this 2011 Annual Report in 
celebration of our 25 years of service to the citizens of Prince George’s County, MD.  
We are particularly grateful to the former Presidents of Charities, pictured on the 
cover of this report, who established, fostered, championed, sustained and 
maintained the organization since 1986.  We also recognize the life-long 
contributions of Mrs. Mary Ray Thompson, who served as the first Executive Director 
of Charities and was one of our most generous supporters until her death in 
September 2011.  
 
Over the past quarter of a century, we have made a significant impact by filling the 
educational and social gaps created by a changing economic environment.   At the 
same time, we recognize that much is expected of an organization blessed with the 
talents and resources of more than 500 member volunteers.  Confronted with the fact 
that Prince George's County students lag behind their peers in the Washington area 
in education; the county has the highest incidence of HIV-AIDS patients including 
youth in the country; and the number of children living in poverty per capita exceeds 
those of any other jurisdiction being served by nonprofits - the challenges are clear. 
Nevertheless our programs have proven to be responsive to the needs of the 
community. Our Popcorn Club tutoring program has helped students in elementary 
school improve their grades from D to honor roll status. A middle school girl who ran 
away from home and was reported on the national news returned home and, as a 
member of our mentoring program, received the counseling that she needed and is 
now a scholar in high school. We have supported nearly 40 students each year with 
scholarships who did not have the finances to attend college. Although the media 
continues to focus on the crime and corruption in our county, we are determined to 
help our youth and their families overcome poverty and disenfranchisement so that 
they can become productive citizens of our county and our nation. 
 
As we embark upon the next two years of this administration, we will focus our 
priorities on increased monitoring of the impact of our programs in the county.  We 
will strengthen relationships with our partners across the Washington area and 
identify additional collaborative efforts.  Most importantly, we will aggressively 
increase our capital campaign to acquire a much-needed facility to better serve our 
community and to more effectively manage our business. 
   
We, along with the members of Charities, are committed to our purpose and to 
finding the best way to help the citizens of Prince George’s County improve their 
lives.  We extend our sincere and wholehearted gratitude to the members of the 
Board of Directors, the Ivy Youth and Family Center Strategic Planning Team, our 
members and supporters for believing in the mission and for having the insight to 
believe that what we do will impact generations to come. 

 
Sincerely, 
 

    
Ingrid S. Harrison                                                         Cheryl Petty Garnette 
President      Executive Director 
 
 

 

  

 

 

Ingrid S. Harrison 

President 

Cheryl Petty Garnette 

Executive Director 
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The Ivy League:  Tutoring and Mentoring At Risk Youth 
 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

               

 

 

                                                                                                                           

 

 

 

 

 

Elementary School 

The Popcorn Club provides a happy and engaging environment where children 

in the first through sixth grades can come to receive help with their homework 

and improve their reading skills.  Every Monday through Thursday, Charities’ 

volunteers provided tutoring for approximately 25 young residents of the 

Overland Gardens Apartments in Hyattsville, MD, that houses more than 400 

low to moderate income families. In addition to tutoring and homework 

assistance, Charities provided periodic field trips to cultural and academic 

settings.  Charities also partnered with Longfields Elementary School in support 

of its Men of Tomorrow after school program by providing program attire and 

tools for school.  In 2011, Charities provided $995 to purchase shirts for the 

young men as well as backpacks of school supplies. 

The Institute for the Growth and 

Development of All of America’s 

Youth (GADAAY) provides the 

opportunity for high school students to 

enhance and cultivate their academic, 

social and leadership potential through 

educational workshops, cultural activities 

and community service projects. Topics 

included financial management for teens, 

college essay and resume writing, public 

speaking and team building, and 

developing social media etiquette. As 

Fellows of the Ivy League, GADAAY 

students also participated in community 

service projects. 

The Emerging Young Leaders (EYL) 

Program strives to encourage positive 

self-imaging, develop leadership skills 

and promote positive community 

involvement among middle school girls.  

The program targeted students in the 

Suitland community, however, middle 

school girls were recruited from across 

the county.  In addition to monthly 

workshops and field trips, a summer 

weekend retreat was held for nearly 50 

youth at Camp Deep Creek in Accident, 

MD funded by a grant from County 

Council Member Karen R. Toles. 

Middle School High School 

2 - right 

 

Parents  

In 2011, we re-instituted the 

Parents on Track Initiative to 

complement the work that we 

had successfully administered 

with our youth. Rather than 

dropping their children off at the 

monthly workshops, we 

encouraged parents to participate 

in workshops designed to 

address their specific issues and 

concerns about parenting. 

Professionals representing a wide 

range of expertise shared their 

wisdom, experiences and 

resources with our parents. 

 

Jessica lives in a housing complex with her brother and mother. Her father is in prison and her mom suffered from 

alcohol dependency. Her brother was a member of our reading enrichment program for elementary school students. 

Jessica learned about our program for teens from her brother and asked her mom about attending. Because her 

mom did not drive, members of our organization arranged for her transportation to the mentoring workshops. As a 

senior in high school, Jessica learned about our Cotillion program. Recognizing that she did not have the funds to 

participate on her own, the members of Charities rallied around Jessica and her family to purchase her dress and 

all of the necessary accessories. During the same year, Jessica was one of 40 students awarded a$1,000.00 college 

scholarship from our organization. She completed her second year of college in 2011. 

“You gave my daughter the dream that she hoped for.  We will always be thankful for Ivy Community Charities!” 

Jessica’s Mother  
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Awarding Scholarly Achievement 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Encouraging Healthy Lifestyles  
 

  
 

Serving Families 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Charities supported nine families headed by single mothers by providing them with new shoes, clothing, and food for 

the holidays, including items for breakfast and dinner.  In addition to these basic needs, Charities offered our Adopted 

Families counseling and employability skills to help the mothers and their teenage children reach a level of economic 

independence. During the holidays, we partnered with the Mall at Prince George’s to set up an Angel Tree on behalf of 

our families. Mall patrons donated gifts, including games and educational toys, or cash that were provided to the four 

families. A total of 60 gifts were delivered for the holidays.  In addition to our adopted families, we donated clothing 

for children and women to the Family Crisis Center of Prince George’s County for victims affected by domestic 

violence. 

 

Since its inception, Charities’ Shoe Bank has provided new shoes and socks to hundreds of youth across the county.  

Although our targeted seasons for supplying shoes are Back to School and Christmas, churches, schools and social 

service organizations can notify us of clients who are in need of shoes any time during the year. Through our Tools for 

Schools initiative, we provided 110 backpacks of school supplies to county residents in time for the opening of school.  

Our adopted families, Ivy League participants and Men of Tomorrow students received the backpacks. 
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Charities awarded Scholarships for Aspiring 

Students in Prince George’s County based on merit 

or need.  In 2011, Charities awarded 26 

scholarships to high school students and five 

scholarships to continuing college students on the 

basis of need for a total of $47,925.00. Charities 

received grants from the Offices of County Council 

Chair Ingrid Turner, County Council Member 

Karen R. Toles, and County Council Member 

Leslie Johnson for a total of $8,000.00 that 

provided seven students with scholarships. 

 

 

  

Charities held its annual 5K Walk/Run/Dance for the Health of It, hosting more 

than 200 participants including County Executive Rushern L. Baker, III, at the 

Watkins Regional Park in Largo, MD. Representatives from national and local 

health organizations provided free counseling and resource materials. Youth 

volunteers received community service credit hours.  We used the opportunity 

to announce our contribution of $2,500 to national and local health 

organizations to encourage community awareness and public support of health 

issues that especially affect the African American community including the 

National Kidney Foundation, Be The Match Foundation of the National Marrow 

Donor Program, American Heart Association, Breast Health, and Autism 

Speaks.  

 

 



Honoring the Elderly 

 

 

  

Support for the Cultural Arts 
 

Charities served as a sponsor of the 12
th

 Annual Harlem Renaissance 

Festival, a unique program established in Prince George’s County to 

recognize the revitalization of the arts. The free event featured an array 

of activities for all ages, including health screenings, book signings, 

musical artists and dynamic panel discussions on topics pertinent to 

improving the quality of life for Prince Georgians. Approximately 

15,000 people attended the annual event. 

 

As funds for the arts in schools were reduced, Charities held its annual 

Summer Arts Camp at the Overland Gardens Community Center for 

the children residing in the apartment complex. The camp targeted 

elementary school students and was designed to help the youth explore 

creative arts in their neighborhood. Similarly our Popcorn Club students 

participated in A Family Literacy Day at the Theatre held at the Atlas 

Performing Arts Center in Washington. Students attended the play, 

Mirandy and Brother Wind, met the cast after the show and received 

gift bags that included the book of the same title.  The field trip was 

underwritten by the Foundation for the Advancement of Music and 

Education (FAME) and co-sponsored by the Prince George’s County 

Reading Council. 

 

In 2011, Charities held its 17
th

 Annual Cotillion~Beautillion at 

Martin’s Crosswinds.  Although the event helped to provide the 

financial resources to support our community outreach activities, it also 

served as a cultural enrichment program to introduce high school 

juniors and seniors to society by providing training in social manners 

and etiquette. 
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Each month members of Charities, known as the Sunshine Club, 

provided assistance to the Elderly Residents of the Forestville Health 

and Rehabilitation Center by playing games, reading, singing, and 

providing manicures. We recognized the residents’ birthdays, treated 

them to a special Black History Month celebration in February and 

conducted a piano concert by student musicians in the spring. 

Toiletries and other personal products are provided to the residents as 

needed. 
 

 

 

 

 

Restoring the Economy 
 

Understanding the economy is the first step in turning our 

financial challenges around.  Charities hosted its first Economic 

Empowerment Fair at the Mall at Prince George’s in order to 

offer our services and local resources to consumers directly where 

they shop. We partnered with area businesses, federal agencies 

and entrepreneurs to provide critical information through 15-20 

minute presentations over four hours. We partnered with the 

Prince George’s County Hispanic Chamber of Commerce, which 

provided an interpreter to convey the information in Spanish.  

Gift cards were awarded to patrons every hour. The event was 

hosted by WHUR’s Taylor Thomas, who is a member of 

Charities. 

 



THE IVY YOUTH AND FAMILY CENTER - A CAPITAL CAMPAIGN 
       “Blessed is she who believes that what the Lord has said to her will be accomplished!” Luke 1:45 
Charities implemented an aggressive capital campaign to acquire the Ivy Youth and Family Center, a facility that 

will meet the needs of the citizens whom we serve across the county.  The Center will house our administrative 

offices, meeting spaces, classrooms and a multi-use room.  Other social service agencies will be invited to share our 

facility where we can provide a one-stop venue of comprehensive services for the community. Charities was 

successfully awarded bond bills from the State of Maryland to match its acquisition efforts up to $500,000.00. We are 

grateful for the support of the following legislators in this effort:  Former State Senator Gloria Lawlah; Delegate 

Carolyn Howard; and State Senator Joanne Benson. Through its fundraising activities, Charities has secured more 

than $200,000.00 held in an investment portfolio.  The fundraising strategies employed in 2011 are presented below.   

 

Individual Contributions 

The primary financial commitment to the Ivy Youth and Family Center rests with the members of Charities. We want 

to particularly acknowledge our Diamond Donors who contributed $10,000.00 or more over the past 12 years of the 

capital campaign:  Dr. Shirley Jackson, Mrs. Beatrice Marshall, Mrs. Mary Ray Thompson (posthumously) and 

Mrs. Gloria Lawlah Walker. The Diamond Donors were honored at our 25
th
 Anniversary Awards Gala in 

December; Mrs. Marshall was unable to attend the event and Mrs. Thompson’s award was accepted by her 

granddaughter. All of the contributors to the Ivy Youth and Family Center from the start of the campaign in 1999 to 

the present are listed in this report. 

                            

 

 

 

 

                                                                                                                                                                                                         

 
 
 

 

 

                  

            

             

                  
 

                 

 

 

 

 drawing of 

facility here as 

watermark. 
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We ranked #1 for the number of 

donors and total funds raised 

among the Prince George’s 

County nonprofits that 

participated in Give to the Max 

Day Greater Washington 2011!  

  
 

Our special thanks to 

Zanielia Harris of Harris and 

Harris Wealth Management 

and Kassandra Rempel, 

Owner of Simply Soles for 

planning and hosting our 

First Shoe Extravaganza at 

the National Harbor in 

December. 

 

Online Giving Campaigns            

We established several new partnerships 

in 2011 in addition to the collaborative 

efforts that have made us successful over 

the past 25 years.  We are indebted to the 

businesses that supported both our 

programs of service and our capital 

campaign efforts. Our partners are listed 

on the inside back cover of this report. 

Support from Local Businesses 
 

http://shawni.smugmug.com/Events/ICC-SimplySoles-Shoe/#1612264130_V99tCgb-A-LB


 
The Jewel Group Initiative 

Recognizing that teamwork is one of the most effective strategies for any type of success, we organized our members 

into 18 teams known as Jewel Groups with the stated mission to leverage their talents, skills and interests to identify 

new and innovative fundraising strategies, including yard sales, stay-at-home tea parties, theatre and restaurant 

outings, floral sales, etc.  As a result of the efforts of the phenomenal Jewel Group Leaders and the commitment of 

their members, we were able to raise more than $50,000 in six months.  This success did not come without its 

challenges, however, we applaud the ingenuity and persistence of our members to use “any financial means 

necessary” for the cause of the Ivy Youth and Family Center. 
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FINANCIAL HIGHLIGHTS 
 

Charities remains on a firm financial footing.  In 2011, we continued our successful fundraising efforts including the 

Annual Fashion Show and Scholarship Luncheon at Martin’s Crosswinds in Greenbelt, MD; the Annual 

Cotillion~Beautillion also held at Martin’s Crosswinds; and the Annual 5K Walk for the Health of It at the Watkins 

Regional Park in Kettering, MD. In addition, we added a new event, Prince George’s County Men Can Cook, which 

was held at the Glenarden Municipal Center hours before Hurricane Danielle struck the Washington area. 
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Opening Balance $161,030.46 

Income Summary:  

Dues: $4,860.00 

Fundraisers: $146,473.88 

Individual Donations: $12,603.28 

Grants: $12,000.00 

Other Income: $36,470.25 

Total Income: $212,407.41 

  

Expense Summary:  

General & Administrative: $17,816.78 

Fundraisers: $91,228.58 

Community Outreach Programs: $94,622.64 

Total Expenses: $203,668.00 

  

Net Gain: $8,739.41 

Closing Balance: $169,769.87 

   Includes Restricted Reserve: $58,386.52 

   Includes Scholarship Endowments (2):  $25,500.00 

  

Ivy Youth and Family Center Capital Campaign: $218,948.69 

  

Total Value of the Organization: $398,022.74 

 

 

 

 



 

 

Community Outreach Contributors 2011:  $1.00-$99.00 

Aaron and Deborah Dock Alonzo Hart Jr. Ann Washington  Belinda Childs  Candice Smith  

Aaron Bristow Althea Mahan Anna Hodges Belinda Taylor Capital Event Boutique 

Adria Tippins Althea Ray Anna L White  Benitta Brown Carl and Camellia Boykin 

Adrian Blount Althia Lee Annaka Begley Nava Bennie A. Mack, Jr. Carliss Ibbott 

Adriana Twitty Alycia Twitty Anthony and Barbara Wright  Bernice Boykin Carlita Head  

Adrienne Little  Alyssa Smith  Anthony Chadwick Bessie Davis Carlton Britt 

Akilah Clark  Amir Lee Anthony Kidd Bessie Jones  Carmen Jackson-Brown 

Akilah Green Amy McTighe Antionette Brooks Betty Adams Caroloyne D. Davis  

Albert Johnson Anabelle Price Antoinette Roberson Betty Cheseman Carolyn Ashby 

Alberta Hamilton Anastasia Benton  Aretha Larsen  Betty Henderson Carolyn Colvin  

Alethea Mahan  Andre Dunston Areyal Hall Betty Issac Carolyn Dent  

Alexandria Briggs Blake Andrea Allen Arlene Simpson Porter Betty Johnson Carolyn Green 

Alexis Braswell Andrea Blake Arnold C Charles, CPA Betty Randel Carolyn Perkins  

Alexis Joyner Andrea Moses  Arthene Pugh Beverley Swaim Staley  Carolyn Piper 

Alexis LeMone Andrea Scotton Ashlee Hayes  Beverly Corbin Carolyn Saunders  

Alexis Smith Andrea Twitty Ashton Johnson  Beverly M. Lee Carolyn Tapscott 

Alfreda Jackson  Andrea Ward-Rose Asia Ferrell Beverly Thompson  Carolyn White 

Alice Hawkins  Andrea Williamson Audrey & Dwayne Harley Jr. Bitrice Higgin Carrie Moore  

Alice I. McKenzie  Angela Battle Audrey Bourke Body Family  Cassandra Evans  

Alice Jackson  Angela Davis Audrey Cushenberry  Body Motions Studio Catherine Courtney 

Alice Swann  Angela L. Thompson Audrey Farley Branch Family  Catherine Delmore 

Alicia Tolson Angela Newsome Audrey Martin  Brandon Savoy  Cathy Bonafede 

Alison Dichieso Angela Scarborough Aundra Roberts Breia Boyd Cathy R. Bacote 

Aliya Jones Angelia Talbert-Duarte Aunita Muhammad  Brenda Hilliard Cavanaugh and Duan P. Smith  

Aliya Trice Angelica C. Harris  B. Felecia Winstead  Brenda Terry-Leonard Cecelia Peets 

Aliyah Matthews Angelica Wesley Barbara Horsey Brenda Watts Cecilia Melvin-Scott 

Allison Mentor Ford Angeline Moore Barbara Phillips Brian Shaw Central High School Staff  

Allison Smith Anhela M. St. Hill  Barbara Smith  Bridgette  Greer Charde Scott-Pearson 

Allyson Solomon  Anish Desai Barrie Moore  Briggs Blake  Charity Wilson 

Almeda Lee Anita Franklin Barry Boykin Broadway Theaters Educate.com Charnel Smith 

Alonzo Bethen Jr Anita Pearson Beatrice Tignor Brotherhood of St. Andrew  Cherea Stoney  

Alonzo C. Taylor Ann Matester 
Belinda A. Bonds 

Candance Green  Cherise Cole 

Charities gratefully accepts contributions from individuals and other philanthropic 

organizations.  Contributions may include cash contributions, bequests, life insurance 

policies, trusts, corporate service matches and appreciated property. Donations can be 

made at www.iccpgc.org. Donors should indicate whether funds are contributed in 

support of the Ivy Youth and Family Center Capital Campaign or to community outreach 

initiatives. 

In 2011, Charities received a contribution from its Founding President, Mrs. Erma W. 

Barron, to establish its second Scholarship Endowment.  The first scholarship fund was a 

$25,000.00 award to establish the District 4 Scholarship Endowment Fund in 2010, thanks 

to the generosity of Prince George’s County Chair Ingrid M. Turner, District 4. The funds 

were received in 2011 with full endowment and will be used to provide scholarships to 

students residing in District 4 of Prince George’s County. 

 

 

 

CONTRIBUTING TO CHARITIES 
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Cheryl Hunter  
Daughters of the King--St. Ann's 

Dorothy G. Brown Faye Preston Gwendolyn Briscoe  

Cheryl James David and Ronda Person & Family  Dorothy Kornegay Felecia James Ross Gwendolyn Nash  

Cheryl Oliver David Ball, Esq. Dorothy S. Marshall Felicia Dupre Hager Franklin 

Cheryl Rowe Shakleford David Bumpass  Dorothy Thomas  Felicia Rogers Halfrocamp/Johnson Family  

Chesapeake Plumbing David McDaniel Dr Alan J Rosen, P.C.  Felisa Ann Wilcher Harold and Electa Lockley  

Chris Charles  Dawn Muhammad  Dr Crispin Ayroso  Felisha Lawrence Harrell Watts, II and Family  

Christian and Cheryl Hosam  Dea. Major L. Anderson II  Dr Karyn M Phillips  Floyd White  Hasaan Lee  

Christina Cecil  Deacon Fred Harris  Dr. and Mrs William Blount & Family  Frances Austin Heather Pinnock 

Christine H. Morton  Deaconess Lynda Harris  Dr. Dorothy Harrison  Francesca Carpenter Heidi O'Gilvie 

Christine Patton  Debbie Anderson Dr. Elvira Doman  Francine Chambliss Helen Callahan  

Christopher Lee Deborah Bell Feddiman Dr. Heidi Oliver Franklin Family  Helen Lewis 

Chrystal R. Mincey  Deborah E. Carter Dr. Juanita Miller  Frederique Thompson Helen Smith  

Church of Atonement  Deborah Freeman Dr. Ruby L. Broadway Fredrick Young  Herbert Allen  

Clarenda Drake Deborah Keith  Earlene Green G. Lynn Davis Herman Flora 

Cleo Belmonte Deborah R. Scott Ebone Green  Gabriella Family Herron Family 

Col. and Mrs. Kevin Peterson Deirde Kilpatrick Ed Cocksey  Gabrielle Holder  Holy Church  

Colleen Moore Delaney O'Gilvie Eddy's Gail and Harold Murray  Hopkins Family  

Collen Deegan Price Delores Richardson Edith Henry Gail Carter Kane Horace Anding 

Columbus Reid  Delores Washington  Edith Taylor Gail Oliver Howard Burnett 

Coretta Howard DeMarcus Knowles Edmund Baird  Gail Savoy  Howard Eason  

Cotillion Directresses  Denise Whalen  White Elaine Johnson Galilee Baptist Church Howard Lane 

Courtney Bracey Deon Muhammad  Elaine R. Christofferson Galloway Samuel Hyacinth Lee 

Courtney Fletcher Der-Chen E. Chang Eleanor Smith Garry Crawford Ian Oliver 

Courtney Potter  Derek E. Brown, DDS, MS, PC  Elissa Krapf 
Gary A Johnson & 
Associates Imani Matthews 

Courtney Wheeler Derrick Brown Elizabeth C. Roberts  Gary Ponder India P. Laws  

Crystal Landers  DeWayne Hawkes Elizabeth Porter  Gay Montague  Irean V. Jones 

Crystal Wilson Dexter Cole Ella Edwards Genevive Goodman Irene Robinson  

Curtis Knowles Diamond Mobley  Ella Lambert  

George and Evangeline 

Murphy Ivy Morris 

Curtis Smalls Diana Lawless Elliott Gibson Jr. Gertrude Harris Jabril Clark  

Cynthia Lipscomb  Diane Paige  Ellis Sylvester Jones Ginger M.  Plummer  Jacqueline G. Johnson  

Cynthia Mills Diane W Thompson  Emery Simmons  Ginneh Stowe Jacqueline Glast 

Cynthia Muhammad  Dolores Crawford Eric Dwight Jones Giselle Mathis Jacqueline Palmer 

Dakota Knowles Dona Moon  Eric Hall Gladys Wilds  Jade Johnson 

Dana Trussell  Donald Thomas  Eric Jones Gloria Durant  Jaden Oliver 

Dani Horston Donine M. Carrington Erwin Boyd Gloria Jones Jahmal Corley  

Daniel Bumpass  Donna Jones  Etelka Randolph Gloria Lee Jakari Partlow 

Daniel Worthy  Donna King  Ethol Tibbs  Gloria McCollum Jalil Clark  

Danielle Boucree Donnetta Hawkins Eudora Plater Godiva Bowman  Jamal A.  Padgett 

Danielle Halsey  Dora and Dawn Carter Evan Coleman Jones Grace Clark James & Doris Pearson 

Danielle Luckett Doreatha Rasin Evangelist Westine Jamieson  Gregory Powell James Allen 

Dapeny McCray Doretha Harrison Evelyn C. Johnson Gregory Thomas  James Berry 

Darieta Cotton Doretta J. Davis Evelyn H. Van Putten  Greta Kendrick  James Chesley 

Darlene Whitaker Doris Cosby  Evelyn Rumph  Gwen Phillips  James Pair 

Darryl Simpkins  Dorothy Ellerbe 
Event Planning  

Gwen Wheeler James Partlow 
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Community Outreach Contributors 2011:  $1.00 - $99.00 continued 



James Philson 
Jordan Camp Kay W. Campbell Lemoria Lester Jr  Makiesha Willis 

James Prather Jordan Partlow Kaya Henderson Leo Bishop Jr Mamie Bennett  

Jamia Anderson Jordan Wilcher Keith Ward/Gideon's Army  Leslie Jenkins  Marcia A. Adams 

Jamil Smith Joseph G. Krassy  Kellie Cosby Lezell Murphy Margaret Franklin 

Jana Reitzes Josette H. Moise Kendra Day- Hernandez Linda Bell Margaret Stowe 

Janae Freeman Joy Peterson Kewanda Williams Linda D. Williams  Maria Floyd 

Jane Short  Joyce Brown  Khadyah B. Baltrop  Linda Robertson Maria Lindsay 

Janet Simmons Joyce Clark  Kim Eason-Marshall  Linda W. Forest Maria Reed 

Janice Riddick  Joyce Davis Kim Faulkner Linda Washington  Marilyn Ashton 

Janice Williams  Joyce Felder Kimberly A. Holmes Lisa Crawford Marilynn Riley  

Janza Pullen Joyce Jones Kimberly Allen Lisa D. Griggs Marina McCulley-Boyd 

Jarvis Boykin Joyce Scanlon  Kimberly Blackstone Lisa Gardner Marlene Fleming-Dillon 

Jasmine Partlow Joyce White Kimberly Stephens Lisa Hickman and Family  Marlon Fletcher  

Jasmine Terry Joyland Christian Family Daycare  Kimora Lee Lisha Penn Marlyn Gains-McCants 

Jasper Woody JTO Krishelia Muhammad  LL Consulting and Creation  Maronda Anderson 

Jaunese L Harris Juanita Orr Kyle Bowman  Lloyd Porter Marsha Mathis 

Jayla Partlow Juanita Williams L.S. Tigner  Lodessa Keitt  Marshall Saylors 

Jean Singletary  Julia G. Riley  LaChele Kellam  Lohren Robinson Marva Jo Camp 

Jeanette Gould Jumpee Stafford La'Kesha Hill Lois Brown Marvin Sloan 

Jeannette Davis Kai Petty-Davis Landover Supermarket Loretta Grey Mary A. Brooks 

Jeannette Harris  Kai Wright Lanee Sheffield  Lori Moore  Mary Alsonia Blunt 

Jeffrey Drexler Kairi Wright Lannie Morehead  Lorraine Buchanan Mary Beverley 

Jen Dewberry Kamari Wilkerson  Lannie's Ceramics  Lorraine Thrash Mary Bloomfield 

Jennifer Aird  Kamryn Mathis LaQuiche Butler Louise Gordon  Mary Compton 

Jennifer Findlele Karen E. Harvey Larry Young  Louise Mullen Mary Lockley 

Jennifer V. Mitchell Karen L. Matthews  Lasandra Hayes  LTC (RET) Winifred E. Turner Mary Smith Harrell  

Jerald and Lolita Boykin Karen M. Catlett LaShawn Matthews LTC John B. Brown Mary Walton 

Jeremy Christopher  Karen Myrie MD  LaTania Jones Lucille Arrendell  Matthew Worthy  

Jerona Family Karen N. Lewis  Latia Mills Lucille Childs  Mattie Sullivan 

Jesse Holland  Karen Spencer Latrese Bennett  Lula Evans Maurene Epps Webb 

Jessica B McGlone  Karin M. Harris  Laurel Frazer Luwanna Clark Maurice Moore 

Jhoel Mercado Karin Williams  Lauren Brown Lynda Bowman Maxine Worthy  

Joan Oladorp Kathleen Jones Lauren Johnson Lynda Sallee Maya Nicholls 

Jocelyn Price Kathleen T. Thomas Lauren Young Lyndell Folsom Melissa Graham  

John & Georgia Pearson Kathy B Summers  Laurie Wilkerson Lynn Davis Mellanese B.  Sims 

John & Mary Anderson Dance Studio Kathy Muhammad  Lavern James Lynn Oliver Melvenia Wright 

John and Cathlean Jones  Kathy Summer Laverne G. Harley Lynnca Ewell Melvin Mitchell 

John Arthur Childs  Katina Williams  LaVerne Lucas  Lyrik Lee Jr Merial Jones 

John Baker Katrina Allen & Family Laverne Scott Lyvia Jeudy Michael A. Valentine  

John Jones Katrina White-Sneed Laverne Wilson Madeleine Downing Michael Brown  

John Mason Katy E. Taylor 

LaWona Green/Teens of 

Praise/SOP Madison Oliver Michael Brown  

John Watson Kaven Pelham Leah White Mae Myers  Michael Davis 

Johnny and Melvina Jones Kawan Taylor LeAmber R. Howell Maggie Torrence Michael McDaniel  

Jonnie O. Isebor  Kay Proctor  Lela Pearl Price Mahendran Velavthapillai Michel Lavarn  
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Community Outreach Contributors 2011:  $1.00 - $99.00 continued 



 
 

Michella Williams  Mr. Derrick Head, Jr  Patricia Marshall  

Rev. Dr. Luna B. 

Abernathy  Savion Walton 

Michelle Davis Mr. and Mrs Alfred Bradley  Patricia Robinson Morrison  Rev. Phyllis Harris Scherida Lambert  

Michelle Garrett MW Wilde Patrick McCarthy Rev. Walter H. Smith Sean Mobley  

Michelle Johnson  Nancy Hawkins Patsy Carpenter Rev. and Mrs. Harding Sehree Mickel 

Michelle Mann Natalie Hubbard Paul Anderson Rhonda Carter-Lawrence Serana Hunter  

Michelle McNeil Gill  Neighbors Automotive  Paul Hagens  Richard Graham, Jr. Serena Parrish  

Michelle Russell Nena Y.  Anyanwu Paula Simpkins  Robert and Irene White  Shannon Harris 

Michelle Williams  Ngozi Onianwah Paulette Brown Robert Corbitt Shannon Lawrence 

Mildred Johnson  Nicole Martin Pearl Stewart Robert Evans  Shanta Dones 

Missy's Munchies  Nicole McLaurin Peggie Hampton Robin N. Moss Sharon Barry  

Mona Chadweck Niki T. Brown  Peggy Wade  Robinson Poyner  Sharon Kirksey 

Monica A. Roebuck Noami Jones  Phyllis Franklin Robyn McIntosh Sharon Phillip jarrett 

Monica Hutcherson  Nola Shelton Phyllis Hubbard Robyn Smith  Sharon Simpson  

Monica Roache Noreta Gwynn Phyllis Sutton Rodney Holder  Sharyn White-Daniels 

Monica Scarlet Norman Brown  Phyllis T Brown  Roger C. Thomas Shaunta Mason 

Monique Smith Norman Thomas Insurance Pics in Motion Studio LLC Rosa & Emory Garris Shawn/Donald Gibson  

Mr. and Mrs Leon Carter  Ntime Floral Design  Portia Joyner Rosa G. Smith Shazada Kashif 

Mr and Mrs Anthony Corbit  Nyrik Lee, Sr Precious Seed, LLC  Rosa Parks Elementary  Sheila Bell 

Mr and Mrs Anthony Williams  Obie Pinckney Priscilla Hollman Rosa's Greek Boutique  Sheila Glenn 

Mr and Mrs Baxter W. Gee  Obie Wright-Price and Atai Price Priscilla Mann Rosina Simmons Sheila Jones 

Mr and Mrs Darrell and Yvette 

Haley  Oiann Bolling Priscilla T. Oredugba Rosslyn Wallace Sheila Pollard  

Mr and Mrs David Boddie  Old Towne Inn  
Professional Healthcare 
Resources Rumph Family  Sheila Rich  

Mr and Mrs Derrick Head, Sr.  Olivia Powell Quantico Officials  Russell Clark Sheila White 

Mr and Mrs Frederick Wheeler  Only Nails  Ralph Page Saade Matthews Sheila Wilson 

Mr and Mrs James and Mary Wade  Ophelia Barley Ramona Powell Saddiq Louisy Shelby Turner  

Mr and Mrs James Childs  Oscar Hinton  Ray and Tina Magnaye Sadiqa Robinson  Shelby Weaver  

Mr and Mrs James Russell  Ossie Lee Raynetta Jackson-Clay Sa'eed Lee Shellie Blakeney 

Mr and Mrs Joseph McCannon  Pagerine Jackson Rebecca C. Talhert  Sakithia Davis Sheridan Cleaners  

Mr and Mrs Kenneth Williams  Paige Givens  Rebecca E. Holley Saleem Lee Sherry Hayes  

Mr and Mrs Milton Holt Sr.  Pam Epperson  Redis C. Floyd Sam and Jannis Franklin  Sherry Richardson 

Mr and Mrs Odell Mullen  Pam Veeden Regina Royster Davis Samuel Fontaine Sherry Saylors 

Mr and Mrs Robert Durham Sr. Pamela King  Renaldo Chapman  Samuel Hunter  Shipley, Horne & Hewlett 

Mr and Mrs Robert Norwood  Pamela S. Eludoyin Rene and Hieu Perez Sanal Kaer Shirley Ali 

Mr and Mrs Stevie Withers  Pamela Smith Renee B. Lucas Sandra Beckham  Shirley Christian 

Mr and Mrs Theorde Butler  Pastor Brendan and Rosalie O'Connor  Renee Crystal Sandra Bright Shirley G. Thompson 

Mr and Mrs Walter  Harris, Jr  Pastor Joe and Maryann Esposito  Renee Jefferson  Sandra Chamber Sierra Bowe 

Mr and Mrs Wayne and Laura 

Tyler  Pat Bell Renee Prince Sandra Kimble Silpada  

Mr. & Mrs. Quarles Patrice Clark Rev and Mrs Robert Hunter  Sandra Williams Sonia & Scott Price 

Mr. & Mrs. T. R. Dues Patricia Brantley Rev Jocelyn Irving  Sarah Bouldin-Carr Sonia Braun 

Mr. and Mrs. Kevin Peterson Patricia Jones-Crosson Rev. Arlie Shrophire Saran Baker  Sophia Worthy  

Community Outreach Contributors 2011:  $1.00 - $99.00 continued 
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Soresi Family  

Teona Wilson Tigger Nicholas Schicon Jackson  Valeria Ford Walter Robinson  

St John CME Church  Terrace Valet Cleaners Tiiara Patton Valerie Evans-Harrell  Walter Smith IV 

Staci Randolph Terri Williams  Tilghman/Keys Family  Valerie Mitchell 

Wanda Childs--Printing Express 

 and Design 

Stacia McFadden The Bowman Family  Timothy Miller Vanessa  Wright Wanda Diggs 

Stacie Lewis The Clay Family  Todd Langley Vanessa Ray Wanda Moore 

Stanford Murray The Cosher Foundation 
Together Forever LLC/ Carolyn 
Tatum  Veera Savoy  Wanda Smith 

Stella Cheeks The Dry Cleaner  Tommy and Marcia Haynes Velma Wynan Wardell Bonner 

Stephanie Moore The Pope Family  Toni Smith Velmenia Stanly Wendy Pittman 

Stephanie Taylor The Porters  Tonja Adams Vemilo and Vilma Monzoh  Wiley Bowling 

Stephanye Maxwell The Sloans Tonya Deskins Venus Coates Wilhemina Walden 

Stephen Green The Tutt Family  Tonya Jackson Venus Pittman William Bell 

Steven Hicks The Wheeler Family  Tonya McCullough Vergie Phifer Willie Gray  

Susan Edwards  Theatrice Davis Tonya Newburn  Vickie Brooks  Wilson Family  

Suzette M. Thomas Thelma Morgan Tonya Riggins  Victor Butler  Winifred Turner 

Sydney Johnson Thelma Petty  Tracey E. Smith Vinnette Greenland, MD  Winston Lampbell  

Sylvia A. Dessiso Theodore Dues Traci M Savoy Viola Bowman  Yvette Douglas  

Sylvia B. Tyner Theona C. Salmon  Tracy Smith --Connoisseur Travel  Viola Lynch  Yvonne Fleming 

Taariq Muhammad  Theona Ponder Trenesha Fultz-Mimms  Violetta  Mason Yvonne Hood 

Tamara Graham  Theresa Salmon Trenessa Hanson  Vision of Love--Erique Berry  Yvonne Wood 

Tanesha Gibson  Third Baptist Church  Trina Petty Vivian V. Mynatt  Zachary Stewart 

Tanyelle Richardson  Thomas Bray Triscina Grey Ortiz  V'Nell DeCosta Zadelsa Stroman 

Tara Taylor Thomas H Adams, Jr. Tyanna Fenner Von Everett Zenita Hurley 

Taylor Camp Thurman Plater Tyra Plater Wallace & Juanita Pearson Zeta Burnette 

Ted Jou Tiffany Lathan    

 
Community Outreach Contributors 2011:  $100.00 - $249.00 

A. Diane Williams  Anthony Slice  Calvin Brown & Associates Clifford Cooper Dashia Wilson 

Aisha Potter  Antoine Bethel Carea Walton Colette Gresham David Randolph 

Al Williams Aura Watts  Carlene Ileto Colleen A. Sprout Debario Fleming  

Alisha Flachs Avis Favors Carlos Abrell  Colleen Bray Debra Palmer-Henry  

Alpha Phi Alpha, Pi Upsilon 

Lambda  BA Ivory & Associates Carol Holland  

Constance Pizzaro, Regional 

Director Debra Price 

Althea Allen  Barbara Ashton Carole Hawkins Cora Floyd  Denise McKenney 

Amanda Welch  Barbara Ford Carole Parrish Corine E. Smith Dewey Robinson  

Amani Robinson Barkley Williams Chandois D. Phillips Cynthia Anderson  Diane Hammonds Gormn 

Amelia Turner  Bernard Howard Charles and Pearlese Williams  Cynthia Williams Dolly D.  Stewart 

Andrea and Charles Harrison  Blair Robinson-Price Cheri Hembry 

D.C Chapter Medicine Alumni 

Assoc. Donna West 

Andristine Robinson Bobby Davis Cheryl Muller-Fils  Dale O'Neal Doris Gillard  

Angela Goldring  Brenda Torrence  Cheryl Jordan Dameon Powell  Doris Hicks 

Angelia Garner  Brenna Graham Chris Learning Center  Danica Starks Dorothy Bailey 

Angelique Williams Brett Gillard  Christian Youth Fellowship  Danielle Simms Dorothy Kim Singleton 

Annabelle Strayhorn Brian McDaniel  Clarice McLeod Daria N. Valentine Dorrence Carrington 

Anthony Chestnut  Caesar and Karen Gooden Clark Family  Darryl Cheatham  Doug Rogers  

Community Outreach Contributors 2011:  $1.00 - $99.00 continued 
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Community Outreach Contributors 2011:  $100.00 - $249.00 continued 

Douglas Bowman Jasmine McLeod LV Lucas Patricia Brown Speak MD Oratory League  

Dr. Jessica Samuel-Shields Jennelle Rush  Lyvonnia Fontaine Patricia Byrd Stacey Walker 

Dr. Marcia Whitaker  Jessie Williams M.C. Terrell Peggy Smith Stacy Wiseman 

Dr. Nellie Adams John Waymmann Maisha Miles Phillip Burrell Stephanie Anderon  

Dr. Norman McKoy  Johnny Clark  Margaret Savoy Phyllis Bunch Stephanie K. Greene  

Dr. Reginald Cole  Jonette Simmons Marilyn Thorne PJ McCarthy Stephanie R. Sprow  

Dr. Shirley Jackson Joreen Benjamin  Marjorie Banks Rachel Robinson Stephanie Wallace 

Edith Wright Joseph and Dorothy Williams Mark Davis  Rachelle Thompson 

Stewardess Board- 

St.John's AME Church 

Elizabeth Lucas Joyce Henderson Marshelle R. Taylor   Rae Hubbard Sunni Degeneste 

Elizabeth Lynn  Joyce Heyward Mary Ann White Randall Dunn  Super Kids Clubhouse  

Ethel Anderson Julia Gay Mary Benson Regina Nelson  Tashica Morgan 

Eula Kean Woods Jureen Benjamin  Michael A. Williams  Remeta Jonson-Williams  Teri Curtis 

Evelyn Brown & Michelle 
Young  Karen Thompson Michelle Lillard Robbyn McIntosh, Attorney The DC Lobbyists LLC 

Felicia Johnson  Karla Waymmann Michelle Terry  Robert & Susan Bies The Ladies of Queen Esther  

Felton Anderson, MD Karleen Powell Monica Scott Robert and Carolyn Chesley  Theresa McClurkin 

Forest Bolden  Katrina Blanchard Morris Davis Robert Youman  Thomas Ferguson  

Fred Vincent Keith Magee Mount Vernon Nursing & Rehab Robin Brown Tiffanie Smith Johnson 

Gale Miller Kenra Shaw Mr. and Mrs. Dwayne Harley  Robin Crawley Tomeka  Bumbry 

Gloria Lawlah Kevin Brown  Mr. and Mrs. George Harley  Ronald J. Pabis/Joseph G. Krasy  Toni Perry 

Gregory Peterson  Khili' Benston Mr. and Mrs. Paul and Lynda Griffin  Rosaline Lyle Jones Tuawana Braxton Pridgen  

Greta Garrett LaTonya Clark  Mr. and Mrs. Purnell Harley  Roselyn V Aker Black  Vanessa G. Smith 

Greyling Chandler Latonya Gentry Myrna Lee  Sallie Cooper Venita Phillips 

Hazel Cameron Laura Wilkinson  Natisha Greenway Sally Higgin Vernon Williams 

Ibrahim Muhammad  LaVerna Savoy Neldra Colwell Samuel Howard Veronica Bradford 

Icelsa Basden  Lawrence Harley III  Nychelle Fleming Sanders Family  Victoria Allen  

Iris Bennett  Les Johnson  Nycole Hollington Sarah Davis  Virgie B. Alston-Rodgers 

Irving and Gladys Wilson  Leslie E. Johnson  Orisadele Family  Serenity Garnette Vivian Bennett 

Ivy Foundation of Northern VA Lessie Williams Orlando Williams Sharlena Graves Walter Neighbors  

Jacquetta Watkins Lezla Gooden Oswald Boykin, III Sharon A. Ottey  Wanda Sabreenah Key 

James and Ana Bolden  Linda Williams Oswald Boykin, Jr Sharon Collins Waymmann Family  

James and Cozetta Adkisson  Lisa Hawkins Paige Grayson Sharon Williams  Wendy Morton-Huddleston 

James O Banks Lois Holland Palmer/Henry Family  Shawnita Pair Wilbert Allen  

James Ranson Lorraine Bell Pamela Johnson Shovna Cooke Willie and Betty Pearson 

Jane Clare Louise Brown Pamela Rios  

Sintias Dominican Salon/ Claudina 

Mesa Yolanda Curtis 

Janet McDonald-Jordan Lucy Lucas Patrice Brown Sondra Petty Yvonne Owens 

Janice Kee Lunch Bunch    
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Community Outreach Contributors 2011:  $250.00 - $499.00  

Aija Rhodes Cheryl Barnes Gay Hayslett LaShawn Knowles Sandra Boswell 

Alphonzo and Sylvia Liggins Cheryl Dixon Georgetown Cupcakes  Lesley Young  Sarah Gilliam 

Amani Young Cheryl Hall Geraldine Kiser Lisa Horton Sharon Allen 

April Battle Conni Evans Hazel Carter Magalene Bowling Shary Jones 

Audie Chesley  Daniel Cardwell Ida M. Keys Margerite Matthews Sylvia Liggins 

Augusta Lynn Bolles David Boddie  Imogene Woodley Maria Bracely Tanya Woods 

Barbara Anderson Deon Clark  Ingrid Turner Maryann Royall Tender Dental Care  

Barbara Patterson Donna Bowe Jacqueline Woody 

Mr and Mrs Earl Ashton 

&Stacey Anderson  The Ancon Group 

Beatrice Leonard Donna Harley  Jaime Gillard  Nancy Palmer Valerie Durant 

Beatrice M. Marshall  Dorothy Prather Jaime Higgins Nona Battle Velma Bowser 

Bettie Johnson Dr. Andrew Clarke Jean Weston Langston Phyllis Morgan Venay Savoy 

Brenda Cadette Ducie's Barbershop John and Alicia Tolson  Pridgen Funeral Service Vera  Chesley 

Carolyn Pinckney Elizabeth Smith Buckmon Karen Fisher Rochelle Andrews Wanda Bright 

Cecillia Sloan-Ashton Erma Barron Kim Boddie Ronald Henderson Wanda Haynes 

Charline Jacob Eunice Sparkman  Kim Cox Ryan Jackson Zelmar Gordon 

 

Community Outreach Contributors 2011:  $500.00 - $749.00 

Evangeline Boykin  Dorine H. Miller Cynthia Poteat Rosalind Daniel Walker Anita Clarke 

Willandria Blount Nyrtha Braxton Cheryl Owens Shirley Patterson Elizabeth Broadway 

Cheryl Petty Garnette Monica Brown Lipscomb Elise Shaw Sandra Boatman Council Chair Ingrid Turner  

Demetrius Windom Margaret Neale Margretta Tinsley   
 

Community Outreach Contributors 2011:  $750.00 - $999.00 

Councilmember Karen Toles Inez Henderson Delores Epps Sandra Benston Dorothy Williams 

Joseph Williams  Lillian Carter Deidre Jackson Iris D. Phillips-Pulliam Carolyn Williams 

Tia Cooper Tammi Brantley Ingrid Harrison  
 

 

Community Outreach Contributors 2011:  $1,000 and above 

Oswald Boykin  Carol Reid Karen Gooden Beverly Franklin Roxanne Paul 

Patricia Braswell Shirley Briggs Rhonda Ferguson Oretha Bridgewater Rochelle Harley 

Cynthia Clarke Kathy Waymmann  Rita Womack  
 

       

14 

  
 



Ivy Youth and Family Center Contributors  - 1999 to 2011 
 

Ivy Emerald Level - $25,000.00 and above: 
The Iota Gamma Omega Chapter of Alpha Kappa Alpha Sorority, Inc. 

 

 Diamond Donor Level - $10,000.00 - $24,999.00 
Dr. Shirley Jackson                         Beatrice Marshall                                  Mary Ray Thompson                                    Gloria Lawlah Walker 

 

Pearl Donor Level - $5,000.00 - $9,999.00 
June Turner                   Marjorie Singleton 

 

Gold Donor Level - $2,500.00 – 4,999.00 
Magalene Bowling             Cheryl Petty Garnette                    Frances Plummer                                     W. Chris Steward 
Ingrid M. Turner            Mary Ann White                     Delceta Wiley 
 

Silver Donor Level - $1,000 .00 - $2,499.00 

Sharon Allen Elizabeth Broadway Carol Holland Virgie Phifer 

Erma Barron Louise Brown Almeda Lee Dorothy Prather 

Mary Benson Rosalind Daniel-Walker Beatrice Leonard Elsie Shaw 

Sandra Benston Theatrice Davis Sylvia Liggins Carolyn Williams 

Bronda Blake-Newman Tanesha Gibson Sandra McDonald Rita Womack 

Bracely, Marie Zelmar Gordon Margaret Neale Tanya Penny Woods 

Cleo Bellamonte Ingrid S. Harrison Juanita Orr  

 

Bronze Donor Level - $500.00 - $999.00 

Ethel Anderson Anita Clarke Gloria Lawlah Gwendolyn Phillips 

Nona Battle Donna Davis Dorine Miller Kathy Waymann 

Jacqueline Benton Inez Henderson Cheryl Muller-Fils Cynthia Williams-Jones 

Deatrice Besong Nycole Hollington Cheryl W. Owens Diane Williams 

Dawn Bracely LaShawn Knowles Lisha Penn Andrea Williamson 

Virgina L. Carter    

 

Alpha Donor Level - $1.00 - $499.00 

Bianca Adkins Vivian Bennett Tammi Brantly Elizabeth Colston Veronica Drake-Butler 

Kelly Alexander Khili Benston Patricia Braswell Neldra Colwell Brenda Eligan 

Andrea Allen Mandisa Berry Robyn Braswell Shauna Cooke Nikeya I Elliott 

Barbara Anderson Sharon Berry Nyrtha Braxton Sallie Cooper Pamela Epperson 

Linda White Andrews Mary Bloomfield Tia Brenckenridge-Tyson Patricia Copelin Delores Epps 

Rochelle Andrews Sandra Boatman Patricia Brown Kim M. Cox Conni Evans 

Joyce Elmore Archer Kim Boddie Paula Brown Loreka A. Credle Audrey Farley 

Sonya Armfield Augusta Lynn Bolles Rita Brown Shirley Gravely Curry Joyce Felder 

Frances V. Austin Sandra Boswell Tarnisha Brown Teri Curtis Adrienne Ferguson 

Dorothy Bailey Ingrid Bough Tomeka Bumbry D.I.V.A.s Maisha Felming-Miles 

Saran Baker/Verizon Audrey Bourke Francesca Carpenter Carolyn Dallas Maria Jean Floyd 

Debra Ballard Donna Bowe Hazel Carter Angela Davis Lyvonnia Fontaine 

Hillary Anne Barksdale Sierra Bowe Jacqueline Chandle Jeanette Davis Barbara Ford 

Sharon Barry Estelle Bowers Jocelyn Chapman Sara Davis Tracy Foster 

April Battle Velma Boswer Grace Clark Weptanomah Davis Lesli Friend 

Linda Bell Robin Bradley Cynthia B. Clarke Maniya Desroches Serenity Garnette 

Gail Lorraine Bell Sarah H. Bradley Glenda Clay Jenmaire Dewberry Greta Garrett 

Latrese Bennett Telisa Bradley 
 
Marlena Colleton-Pearsell Cheryl  Dixon Lisa German 

 

. 
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Daveisha Gibson 
Dorothy Holland 

Tania I. Martin Sondra Petty Melissa S. Silva 

Lossie Gibson Marilyn Holland Karen Matthews Carolyn N. Pinckney Kim D. Singleton & Associates 

Sara T. Gilliam Yvonne Hood Rose M. Matthews Carolyn Lyons Piper Corine E. Smith 

Phyllis Gilliams Elizabeth Howard Marina McCulley Cynthia Poteat Peggy Smith 

Jacaqueline Glast Marion E. Howard Denise McKenney  Karleen Powell Tiffany Smith 

Jeanette Gould Rae L. Jones Hubbard Alice McKenzie Deborah Price Elizabeth Smith-Buckmon 

Shirley Gravely-Curry Bettie Hudson Nicole McLaurin Debra Evan Price Stephanie  Sprow 

Marcie Gray Charlene Ivy Clarise McLeod Joycelyn Price Natalie Stephenson 

Paige Grayson Deidre Jackson Karen McLeod Tuawana Pridgen Joan Stevens 

Norita Gwynn Francena P. Jackson Shawn McLeod Robyne Prince Jeanette Steward 

Joan Hall Shawn Jackson Doris Mebane Betty Randel Pearl E. Stewart 

Dora Halton Rachel K. Jefferies Juanita Miller Stephanie Randle Tressie Stout 

Alberta Hamilton Jayne Howell Johns Crystal Mincey Aija Rhodes Margaret Stowe 

Rochelle Harley Bettie Johnson Joyce Minor Corene Richardson Annabelle Strayhorn 

Cora Harper Leslie Johnson Gay Montague Delores Richardson Geranda Melissa Stroman 

Olivia Harris Mary G. Johnson Wendy Morton Sherry Richardson Tracee Strum-Gilliam 

Lisa Hawkins Michelle Johnson-White Mae Myers Aundra Roberts Kathy Summers 

Wanda Haynes Gloria Jones Heidi O'glivie Andristine Robinson Edith Taylor 

Gay M. Hayslett Janice Kee Yvonne Owens Blair Robinson Stephanie Taylor 

Carlita Head Gracie Kenon P.E.A.R.L.S. 2011 Rachel Robinson Jennie Montgomery Thomas 

Shirleen Henry-Lewis Geraldine Kiser Shawnita Pair Rosa's Greek Boutique Lenan W. Thomas 

Carol Herring Reid Phylis Knight Nancy Palmer Deborah Roundtree Victorie Thomas 

Doris Hicks Dorothy Kornegay Debra Palmer-Henry Maryann M. Royall Doris Thompson 

Jamie Higgins Wendy Lewis Carole J. Parrish Jenelle Rush Margretta Tinsley 

Tomeka Hinton Lucy Lucas Barbara Patterson Lynn Saffold-Davis Gail Fain Tyler 

Anna Hodges Priscilla Mann Toni Perry Laverne Scott Winona Tyler 

Christol Salon and Spa     

 

Men of the Ivy Levels 
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Alpha Donor Level - $1.00 - $499.00 continued 

In 2011, we instituted the Men of the Ivy 

contribution levels to acknowledge the 

distinguished men of the community who 

contributed to the capital campaign at the $500.00 

(Bronze) and $1,000.00 (Silver) levels.  The first 

contributor was Mr. Allen Jackson at the Silver 

Level ($1,000.00). The men were recognized at our 

25
th
 Anniversary Awards Gala held at the Sheraton 

Washington North Hotel in Beltsville, MD in 

December. 

 

Silver Level:   $1,000.00 
 

Mr. John Gordon                                      Mr. Allen Jackson 

 

Bronze Level:  $500.00 
 

Dr. John E. Garnette                                Rev. John Waymmann 

 

 

Featured with their wives are Men of the Ivy contributors: 

 Rev. John Waymmann and Kathy; Dr. John Garnette and Cheryl;  

Mr. John Gordon and Zelmar; and Mr. Allen Jackson and Shirley. 



25
th

 Anniversary Recognition of Community Outreach Corporate and Civic Funders 

Allstate Foundation                     Former County Council Member Camille Exum  

The Honorable Karen R. Toles Former County Council Member Leslie Johnson 

Care First-Blue Cross/Blue Shield Giant Food Stores, Inc.      

The Honorable Ingrid M. Turner Safeway Stores, Inc.      

Former County Council Member Samuel Dean          Wegman’s, Inc. 

Prince George’s County Department of Housing and Community Development 

 

25
th

 Anniversary Recognition of Community Outreach Business, Civic and Community Partners 

  

All Shades of Pink Payless Shoe Store 

Alpha Kappa Alpha Sorority, Inc., Eta Chapter Pearl Consulting Group 

Alpha Kappa Alpha Sorority, Inc., Iota Gamma Omega Chapter Prince George’s Philharmonic 

Alpha Kappa Alpha Sorority, Inc., Theta Nu Chapter Prince George’s County Council 

Alpha Kappa Alpha Sorority, Inc., Upsilon Tau Omega Chapter Prince George’s County Department of Social Services 

Alpha Phi Alpha Fraternity, Inc., Kappa Epsilon Lambda Chapter Prince George’s County Fire Department 

Alpha Phi Alpha Fraternity, Inc., Psi Upsilon Lambda Chapter Prince George’s County Department of Housing and Comm. Dev. 

ARi Financial Solutions Prince George’s County Financial Services Corporation 

BB&T Bank Prince George’s County Neighborhood Stabilization Department 

Capital One Bank Prince George’s County Public Library System 

Charles Herbert Flowers High School Prince George’s County Public Schools 

Drew Freeman Middle School Prince George’s County Sheriff’s Office (Michael Jackson) 

Forestville Health and Rehabilitation Center Rexford Place Assisted Living Facility 

Glenarden Woods Elementary School Ron Higgins/Savannah Movie Tours 

Harlem Renaissance Foundation Sarge, Inc. 

Hispanic Chamber of Commerce Small Business Administration 

Howard University Hospital Sickle Cell Center Suitland Crime Action Team 

Kappa Alpha Psi Fraternity-Hyattsville/Landover Chapter SunTrust Bank 

Lamont Elementary School STEP (Substance Abuse Treatment, Education and Prevention)  

Learn Foundation, Inc. The NAI/Michael Companies 

Links, Inc. Tuxedo Junction 

Longfields Elementary School Winn Residential/Overland Gardens Community  

Omega Psi Phi Fraternity, Inc., Gamma Pi Chapter Lanham Boys and Girls Club 

 

25
th

 Anniversary Recognition of Ivy Youth and Family Center Capital Campaign Partners 
 

Alpha Kappa Alpha Sorority, Inc., Iota Gamma Omega Chapter    Pfizer Foundation 

Arthur Horne, Attorney at Law Kassandra Remple, Owner, SimplyShoes 

Christol Salon and Spa Verizon Foundation 

The Honorable Joann Benson Dr. Marie Washington 

The Honorable Carolyn J.B. Howard Zaneilia Harris, Harris and Harris Wealth Management 

Former State Senator Gloria Lawlah Rita’s, Chick-fil-a, and Texas Roadhouse 
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P.O. Box 7709 

Upper Marlboro, MD  20792-7709 

www.iccpgc.org  

301-390-3868 

Corporate Officers 
 

Ingrid Harrison, President 

Saran Baker, Vice President 

Andrea Williamson, Acting Recording Secretary 

Andrea Williamson, Corresponding Secretary 

Airienne Jeffery, Treasurer 

Marshelle Taylor, Assistant Treasurer 

Zelmar Gordon, Financial Secretary 

Dareth Wallace, Assistant Financial Secretary 

Mandisa Berry, Parliamentarian 

Nythra Braxton, Chaplain 

Maisha Miles, Historian 
 

Executive Director 

Cheryl Petty Garnette 
 

Finance Director 

Sharon Allen 
 

Resource Development Chair 

Rochelle Andrews 
 

Ivy Youth and Family Center Project Manager 

Rosalind Daniel Walker 

 

Directors-at-Large 

 

Mary Benson 

Donna Bowe 

Tomeka Bumbry 

Anita Clarke 

Conni Evans 

Carolyn N. Pinckney 

Cynthia Poteat 

Corine Smith 

Karen Thomas 

Karen Thompson 

Rosalind Daniel Walker 

Kathy Keys Waymmann 

Angelique Williams 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2011 Ivy Youth and Family Center  

Strategic Planning Team 
Front left to right: 

Seated: Saran Baker, Ingrid S. Harrison, and Cheryl Petty Garnette 

Standing: Rosalind Daniel Walker, Anita Clarke, and Tanya Penny Woods  

Not pictured:  Rochelle Andrews, Jennifer Jones and Ann Wheeler 

2011 Board of Directors 

From left to right: 

Seated:  Maisha Miles, Ingrid S. Harrison, 

Cheryl Petty Garnette and Andrea Williamson. 

Standing:  Zelmar Gordon, Nyrtha Braxton, 

Rosalind Daniel Walker, Anita Clarke, Saran 

Baker, Marshelle Taylor and Karen Thompson. 

 

  

http://www.iccpgc.org/

